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Transfercar Confirmation Budget REZ 3438-1945-AU-3

7 messages

Christine Farrell <cfarrell@abvic.com.au>
To: yousufzia67@gmail.com <yousufzia67@gmail.com>

Thu, 30 Oct 2025 at 10:28 am

Cc: Avis Budget Airport West <airportwest@abvic.com.au>, Jorg Winthorst <jorgw@abvic.com.au>, Budget Gladesville
<gladesville@budgetnsw.com.au>, Joshua Jones <Joshua.Jones@budgetnsw.com.au>, Sandy Martin <smartin@abvic.com.au>

Good morning Muhammad,

Further to our telephone conversation | wish to confirm your Transfercar — Intermediate SUV or similar from our Airport

West, Melbourne to Gladesville, Sydney.

Please return vehicle with a full tank of FUEL. Any Road Tolls used will be at your own cost and charged to your Debit/

Credit Card supplied.

Please Note “Overhead & Underbody Damage” is not covered by Insurance.

Reservation No: 3438-1945-AU-3

Pick Up: Saturday 01st Nov @ 08.00am
Return: Monday 03rd Nov @ 08.00am

Pick Up Location: Budget Rent A Car — Airport West

54 HALSEY ROAD
AIRPORT WEST VIC,3042,AU

PHONE: 03 9131 8800

Drop Off Location: = Budget Rent A Car - Gladesville

31 HIGGINBOTHAM RD
GLADESVILLE NSW,2111,AU

PHONE: 02 9059 5222

Please bring with you on vehicle Pick Up
Bond $400

Your hard copy Debit/Credit Card


https://www.google.com/maps/search/54+HALSEY+ROAD++%0D%0A%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82AIRPORT+WEST+VIC,3042?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/54+HALSEY+ROAD++%0D%0A%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82AIRPORT+WEST+VIC,3042?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/31+HIGGINBOTHAM+RD++%0D%0A%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82+GLADESVILLE+NSW,2111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/31+HIGGINBOTHAM+RD++%0D%0A%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82+GLADESVILLE+NSW,2111?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/31+HIGGINBOTHAM+RD++%0D%0A%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82%E2%80%82+GLADESVILLE+NSW,2111?entry=gmail&source=g

Full hard copy Drivers Licence
2 x Contact Telephone numbers

Third form of ID showing current home address (Utility bill/ Bank Statement)

Standard terms and conditions apply.

Warm regards,

Christine Farrell | Manager

Payne Investments Pty Ltd | T/A Budget Car & Truck Rentals
302 Kororoit Creek Road, Williamstown North,3016,au

Ph: (03) 91318878 | Email: altonanorth@abvic.com.au | W: www.budget.com.au

AVIS == PZBudget

Car and Truck Rental

Yousuf zia <yousufzia67@gmail.com> Thu, 30 Oct 2025 at 10:45 am
To: Christine Farrell <cfarrell@abvic.com.au>

Hi Christine, thanks for your email.
Can | be felxible with the pick up time on 1st Novemeber?
I would like to pick up around 9 pm. Please do let me know if that works for you.

Regards,

Yousuf
[Quoted text hidden]

Christine Farrell <cfarrell@abvic.com.au> Thu, 30 Oct 2025 at 10:47 am
To: Yousuf zia <yousufzia67@gmail.com>

Hi Yousuf,

That will be fine.

Christine

[Quoted text hidden]



https://www.google.com/maps/search/302+Kororoit+Creek+Road,+Williamstown+North,3016?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:altonanorth@abvic.com.au
http://www.budget.com.au/

Yousuf zia <yousufzia67@gmail.com> Thu, 30 Oct 2025 at 10:48 am
To: Christine Farrell <cfarrell@abvic.com.au>

Thanks.

Regards,

Yousuf
[Quoted text hidden]
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Yousuf zia <yousufzia67@gmail.com> Sat, 1 Nov 2025 at 1:53 pm
To: Christine Farrell <cfarrell@abvic.com.au>

Hi Christine, this place is closed. | am at the location. Can | please have a contact number to call?

On Thu, 30 Oct 2025, 10:28 am Christine Farrell, <cfarrell@abvic.com.au> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

Yousuf zia <yousufzia67@gmail.com> Sat, 1 Nov 2025 at 2:23 pm
To: customerservice.budget.au@contactcenter.abg.com

Fyi. Please

Regards,

Yousuf
[Quoted text hidden]
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Budget Customer Service Au <donotreply@contactcenter.abg.com> Sat, 1 Nov 2025 at 2:23 pm
Reply to: donotreply@contactcenter.abg.com
To: Yousuf zia <yousufzia67@gmail.com>

Thank you for contacting the Customer Service Centre for Budget Rent a Car.

Your email is in queue and will be handled in the order that it was received. Please note that Customer Service primarily assists with
post rental billing enquiries.

If your enquiry is regarding pre-rental questions for a Budget Australia reservation, please submit your request to
reservations@budget.com.au

If you wish to request a copy of your Budget tax invoice you may submit your enquiry to invoices@budget.co.nz .
You may retrieve a copy of your Budget receipt via https://www.budget.com.au/en/reservation/get-e-receipt

You may obtain a copy of your Australia Toll road receipts from Linkt via their website. You can also contact Linkt on 13 33 31 or via
email at customersyd@linkt.com.au.

Please keep any email requests to under 3MB in size including any attachments. Plain text without embedded graphics and URLS is
preferred.

Thank you.
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